Gangmasters &
Labour Abuse Authority

Freedom of Information Act Request

Ref: FOI 22-23 06 Date issued: 17 August 2022

Subject: Request for documents pre-2010

Question(s):

To assist me with my academic research, would you please arrange for copies of the
following documentation to be sent to me:

1) A full copy of the Minutes of all meetings from April 2010 to November 2010 that
may be numbered consecutively from approximately 26/8.7 through to 27.71.
Meetings may include GLA Board meetings, Liaison meetings, general literature
etc.

2) Full copies of any GLA and GLAA Annual Review Executive summaries for the
years 2005, 2006, 2007, 2008, 2009, 2010 and any consecutive Executive
summaries to the present day.

3) Supermarket and Suppliers Protocol 2010

Response:

Under the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA), certain information is exempt from release.
One exemption under section 21 (1) applies to information that is reasonably accessible
to the applicant by other means. Your request falls into this category. The following is
available on the GLAA website:

1) Minutes for the period between April 2010 to November 2010 can be found online
here: [link no longer available]. This includes Board minutes and various papers
including Labour Provide Liaison Group minutes. Your request for ‘general
literature’ is too broad. Under our duty to assist under s16 of the FOIA we may
reconsider your request if you are able to narrow the focus of the request.

2) We do not hold copies of the Annual Reviews and Executive Summaries that you
reference. Under our Duty to Assist (s16), we advise you to look at the GLA(A)
page on the National Archives website available online here:
https://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/ukgwa/*/http:/www.gla.gov.uk/. You
may be particularly interested in the research page here:
https://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/ukgwa/20120425170059/http://gla.defra
.gov.uk/Who-We-Are/Research/

3) We do not hold a copy of the original Supermarket Protocol. Under our Duty to
Assist (s16), we advise you to look at the National Archives website, particularly
this



https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwebarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk%2Fukgwa%2F*%2Fhttp%3A%2Fwww.gla.gov.uk%2F&data=05%7C01%7Cfoi%40gla.gov.uk%7Ca97c244339d6468b93d208da7efad4c1%7Cf24d93ecb2914192a08af182245945c2%7C0%7C0%7C637961913134451628%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=XyGda6zRZ2%2BULcAsjJMlHhRMzr%2FTYV6wnsYVp26%2FGXw%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwebarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk%2Fukgwa%2F20120425170059%2Fhttp%3A%2Fgla.defra.gov.uk%2FWho-We-Are%2FResearch%2F&data=05%7C01%7Cfoi%40gla.gov.uk%7Ca97c244339d6468b93d208da7efad4c1%7Cf24d93ecb2914192a08af182245945c2%7C0%7C0%7C637961913134451628%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=M%2F%2BtBvcF9S4WenaIbQcvmpOmx7e%2FjEn93bSI1sDEn7k%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwebarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk%2Fukgwa%2F20120425170059%2Fhttp%3A%2Fgla.defra.gov.uk%2FWho-We-Are%2FResearch%2F&data=05%7C01%7Cfoi%40gla.gov.uk%7Ca97c244339d6468b93d208da7efad4c1%7Cf24d93ecb2914192a08af182245945c2%7C0%7C0%7C637961913134451628%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=M%2F%2BtBvcF9S4WenaIbQcvmpOmx7e%2FjEn93bSI1sDEn7k%3D&reserved=0

page: https://webarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk/ukgwa/20100304111307/http://w
ww.gla.gov.uk/

We advise you to save any documents you wish to review for your research, as we may
remove them from the GLAA website in the future in line with our retention and
destruction schedule.

*Please note, since this FOI response was sent some links are no longer available
on the GLAA website.



https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwebarchive.nationalarchives.gov.uk%2Fukgwa%2F20100304111307%2Fhttp%3A%2Fwww.gla.gov.uk%2F&data=05%7C01%7Cfoi%40gla.gov.uk%7Ca97c244339d6468b93d208da7efad4c1%7Cf24d93ecb2914192a08af182245945c2%7C0%7C0%7C637961913134451628%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=bRRk4KygxrZ03OBgb7eHXTHz3Arl2P9ECHn0ppO4gng%3D&reserved=0
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